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By Nicholas Orme

This book explores the education of the English kings and aristocracy from
the Norman Conquest to the early Tudor period. It examines the different
types of education available to the ruling elite, the role of the Church in
education, and the impact of education on the development of English
society and culture.

The book begins by examining the education of the Anglo-Saxon kings and
aristocracy. This education was largely based on the study of Latin and the
Bible, and was provided by the Church. The Norman Conquest brought
about a number of changes to the education of the English ruling elite. The
new Norman kings and aristocracy were more interested in the study of
French and the secular arts, and they began to establish new schools and
universities.
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The Church continued to play a major role in the education of the English
kings and aristocracy throughout the Middle Ages. However, the rise of the
universities in the 12th and 13th centuries led to a decline in the importance
of the Church's role in education. The universities offered a more secular
education, and they began to attract a wider range of students, including
the sons of the middle class.

The education of the English kings and aristocracy had a significant impact
on the development of English society and culture. The ruling elite were the
patrons of the arts and sciences, and they played a major role in the
development of English literature, music, and architecture. The education
of the ruling elite also helped to shape the political and social institutions of
England.

The Early Years

The education of the English kings and aristocracy in the early years after
the Norman Conquest was largely based on the study of Latin and the
Bible. This education was provided by the Church, and it was designed to
prepare the ruling elite for their roles in government and society.

The most important schools for the education of the English kings and
aristocracy were the cathedral schools. These schools were located in the
major towns and cities of England, and they were staffed by some of the
most learned men in the country. The curriculum at the cathedral schools
included grammar, rhetoric, logic, and theology.

In addition to the cathedral schools, there were also a number of other
schools that provided education for the English kings and aristocracy.



These schools included the royal schools, the schools of the great
monasteries, and the schools of the minor nobility.

The royal schools were established by the Norman kings to provide
education for their sons and other members of the royal family. The schools
of the great monasteries were also very important centers of learning, and
they attracted students from all over England.

The schools of the minor nobility were less well-funded than the royal
schools and the schools of the great monasteries. However, they still
provided a valuable education for the sons of the lesser nobility.

The Later Middle Ages

The education of the English kings and aristocracy in the later Middle Ages
was more varied than it had been in the early years after the Norman
Conquest. The rise of the universities in the 12th and 13th centuries led to
a decline in the importance of the Church's role in education. The
universities offered a more secular education, and they began to attract a
wider range of students, including the sons of the middle class.

The most important universities in England were Oxford and Cambridge.
These universities were founded in the 12th century, and they quickly
became centers of learning and culture. The curriculum at Oxford and
Cambridge included grammar, rhetoric, logic, theology, law, and medicine.

In addition to the universities, there were also a number of other schools
that provided education for the English kings and aristocracy in the later
Middle Ages. These schools included the Inns of Court, the schools of the
great monasteries, and the schools of the minor nobility.



The Inns of Court were law schools that were located in London. These
schools were attended by the sons of the nobility and gentry who wished to
pursue a career in law.

The schools of the great monasteries continued to be important centers of
learning in the later Middle Ages. However, their importance declined
somewhat as the universities grew in popularity.

The schools of the minor nobility were less well-funded than the universities
and the schools of the great monasteries. However, they still provided a
valuable education for the sons of the lesser nobility.

The Renaissance

The Renaissance was a period of great change in the education of the
English kings and aristocracy. The Renaissance was a time of renewed
interest in the classical learning of Greece and Rome. This interest in
classical learning led to a number of changes in the curriculum of the
schools and universities.

The most important change in the curriculum was the of the study of Greek.
Greek was the language of the ancient Greeks, and it was considered to be
the language of learning and culture. The study of Greek led to a greater
understanding of the classical world, and it had a major impact on the
development of English literature, philosophy, and science.

In addition to the study of Greek, the Renaissance also saw the of the
study of other classical subjects, such as history, rhetoric, and grammar.
These subjects helped to develop the intellectual skills of the students, and
they prepared them for their roles in government and society.



The Renaissance also saw the rise of the public schools. These schools
were founded by wealthy merchants and other members of the middle
class. The public schools provided a more secular education than the
traditional schools of the Church, and they attracted a wider range of
students.

The most important public schools were Eton College and Winchester
College. These schools were founded in the 15th century, and they quickly
became centers of learning and culture. The curriculum at Eton and
Winchester included grammar, rhetoric, logic, theology, law, and medicine.

The Reformation

The Reformation was
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